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WEBINAR
CALL FOR PROPOSALS!

We are looking for presenters to join our vibrant and 
engaged virtual learning community! Please consider 
submitting a proposal for the upcoming Florida Center for 
Inclusive Communities (FCIC) Webinar Series and sharing with 
your colleagues.

To build capacity around effective workplace inclusion, 
transitions and customized employment within the state, FCIC 
offers a variety of training and technical assistance. In these 
activities, the latest training and technical assistance are 
provided to CAC Members, FCIC staff families, Employment 
First, FDDC Grass Roots, community rehabilitation providers, 
school districts, and state agencies concerned with the 
development and implementation of employment supports, 
services, and policies for people with disabilities.

FCIC offers vibrant and engaged virtual learning community 
every third Tuesday of the month. We will also feature quarterly 
Lunch n Learns. Viewers participate in discussions, share 
experiences, and receive technical assistance in the application 
of strategies, resources, and best practices to increase 
employment of people with intellectual and developmental 
disabilities. 

Our viewership is comprised of self-advocates, family 
members, professionals in disability field, community 
members, employment professionals, and state agency 
professionals. This year we want to focus on IDD and self-

advocacy, self-determination, inclusion, collaborations, 
technology, employment, benefits/work-incentives, and 

post-COVID improvements relating to the employment of 
persons with developmental disabilities.

Webinars and Lunch N Learns Schedules:  

• Webinars are held from 4:30 PM to 6 PM.  

• Lunch N Learns are held from Noon to 1 PM.  Dates are 
flexible and do not coincide with any webinar. 

All events will occur via MS Teams or Zoom.  

Certificates of Attendance will be provided to those who fully 
complete the survey. Certificates will be submitted to APD for 
CEU hours.  Most sessions will be recorded and later uploaded 
on our website at https://flfcic.cbcs.usf.edu/employment.html or 
uploaded to You Tube at https://www.youtube.com/user/fcicusf.

Interested? Fill out the Call for Proposal Response Form 
here: https://forms.office.com/r/sac3fSJejY

For more information, please contact event organizer, 
Denise R. Barnes, MA, FCIC Employment Coordinator at  
drbarnes@usf.edu or 813-974-1063.
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